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(i) 

 

Friday, 28 February 2014 
 

DEVELOPMENT MANAGEMENT COMMITTEE 
 

A meeting of Development Management Committee will be held on 
 

Monday, 10 March 2014 
 

commencing at 2.00 pm 
 

The meeting will be held in the Burdett Room, Riviera International  
Conference Centre, Torquay 

 
 

Members of the Committee 

Councillor McPhail (Chairwoman) 

 

Councillor Morey (Vice-Chair) 

Councillor Addis 

Councillor Baldrey 

Councillor Barnby 

 

Councillor Kingscote 

Councillor Pentney 

Councillor Stockman 

Councillor Brooksbank 

 

 

 

Working for a healthy, prosperous and happy Bay 



(ii) 

DEVELOPMENT MANAGEMENT COMMITTEE 
AGENDA 

 
1.   Apologies for absence  
 To receive apologies for absence, including notifications of any 

changes to the membership of the Committee. 
 

2.   Minutes (Pages 1 - 5) 
 To confirm as a correct record the Minutes of the meeting of this 

Committee held on 10 February 2014. 
 

3.   Declarations of Interests 
 

 

(a)   To receive declarations of non pecuniary interests in respect of 
items on this agenda 

 

 For reference:  Having declared their non pecuniary interest 
members may remain in the meeting and speak and, vote on the 
matter in question.  A completed disclosure of interests form should 
be returned to the Clerk before the conclusion of the meeting. 
 

(b)   To receive declarations of disclosable pecuniary interests in respect 
of items on this agenda 

 

 For reference:  Where a Member has a disclosable pecuniary 
interest he/she must leave the meeting during consideration of the 
item.  However, the Member may remain in the meeting to make 
representations, answer questions or give evidence if the public 
have a right to do so, but having done so the Member must then 
immediately leave the meeting, may not vote and must not 
improperly seek to influence the outcome of the matter.  A 
completed disclosure of interests form should be returned to the 
Clerk before the conclusion of the meeting. 
 
(Please Note:  If Members and Officers wish to seek advice on any 
potential interests they may have, they should contact Governance 
Support or Legal Services prior to the meeting.) 
 

4.   Urgent Items  
 To consider any other items that the Chairman decides are urgent. 

 
5.   P/2014/0045/OA Land at Waterside Road, Paignton (Pages 6 - 13) 
 3 No. Detached dwellings and associated access/parking provision. 

 
6.   P/2013/1179/VC Yalberton Tor Quarry, Yalberton Road, 

Paignton 
(Pages 14 - 19) 

 Variation of Condition 3, 5, 27 and 28  (P/2010/0638  Phased 
approach to recovering and disposing of in-situ and imported waste, 
the progressive land filling of the quarry void with inert waste and 
the construction of an appropriate geological barrier in conjunction 
with waste recycling operations and restoration and ceasing of 
mineral extraction). 
 



(iii) 

7.   P/2013/1282/MRM Land At Brixham Road, Yannons Farm (Area 
A), Paignton 

(Pages 20 - 32) 

 Erection of retail building (Use Class A1), with associated access, 
parking, service yard and plant; health centre (Use Class 
D1/A1/A2), with associated access and parking; mixed use building 
comprising 6 no. 2-bed flats (affordable) and 2 no. commercial units 
(Use Class B1/A1/A2/A3/D1), with associated access and parking; 4 
no. 2-bed dwellings (affordable) and 5 no. 3-bed dwellings 
(affordable), with associated access and parking; associated roads, 
parking, play area, amenity space, landscaping and substation to 
form a Local Centre (reserved matters relating to 
P/2010/0289/MOA). 
 

8.   P/2013/1209/MPA Palace Hotel, Babbacombe Road, Torquay (Pages 33 - 52) 
 Erection of single and two storey roof level hotel bedroom 

extension. Reconstruction of west wing of hotel.  Reconstruction of 
existing three storey wing on NE elevation to provide 4 storey block 
of additional guest accommodation.  New Spa and gym facilities to 
SE elevation and replacement Orangery.  Redevelopment of 
existing garage building to provide 73 car parking spaces and an 
additional 40 spaces to hotel frontage.  Construction of 137 flats 
with leisure facilities on tennis court site with 181 covered car 
parking spaces and 24 visitor spaces. Restoration of gardens, 
woodland management, including limited felling of TPO trees and 
improvements to local footpaths. 
 

9.   P/2014/0030/MPA The Pines, 78 St Marychurch Road, Torquay (Pages 53 - 55) 
 Re submission of P/2013/1070 for a new four storey residential 

apartment block comprising 14 units with associated car parking St 
Marychurch Road, Torquay.  Amendments comprising relocation of 
building forwards in the plot and revised roof design. 
 

10.   Public speaking  
 If you wish to speak on any applications shown on this agenda, 

please contact Governance Support on 207087 or email 
governance.support@torbay.gov.uk before 11 am on the day of the 
meeting. 
 
 

11.   Site visits  
 If Members consider that site visits are required on any of the 

applications they are requested to let Governance Support know by 
5.00 p.m. on Wednesday, 5 March 2014.  Site visits will then take 
place prior to the meeting of the Committee at a time to be notified. 
 

 Note  
 An audio recording of this meeting will normally be available at 

www.torbay.gov.uk within 48 hours. 
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